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Hi Tori and Kristin, 
  
The revised budget included only what we are asking the committe to consider.  The 
additional funding and inkind services that the library, municipal properties and the 
highway department are still the same.  We are asking for a total of $119,000 and will 
provide the original $12,500 in funding and inkind services as outlined below. 
  
1. Preliminary architect study (Library gift account):  $3,000  
2. Landscape materials (Tree Planting Fund):   $2,500 
3. Labor by Municipal Properties Crew:    $2,000 
4. Labor from Highway Dept (ramp):    $1,000  
5. Supplies from Municipal Properties operating budget $   500  
4. Project supervision by Municipal Properties Director: $3,500 
 
TOTAL COST SHARE & IN KIND SERVICES:   $12,500 
  
Thanks again for your consideration and I'll plan on attending the meeting Thursday night to answer any 
other questions. 
  

Jennifer Friedman 
Librarian 
West Acton Citizens' Library 
21 Windsor Ave. 
Acton, MA 01720 
978-264-9652 
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Hi Jennifer,  I bet you wish you were back in Florida this week!!! 
     The only question/request we have is the actual division of funds.  You submitted a revised budget, 
but we can't tell exactly how much you wish to have CPC provide. 
There was a total, we just need to know how much the library is contributing and how much CPC is 
contributing. 
If you would let Kristen know, she will revise our spreadsheet.  And of course we need it right away 
because I didn't email you sooner.  If Kristen could have it by Wed. she can add it to our Thurs. mtg. info. 
Any questions, pls let me or Kristen know. 
Thanks very much, Tory 



----- Original Message -----  
From: Jennifer Friedman  
To: Tori Beyer (home)  
Sent: Tuesday, January 29, 2008 5:09 PM 
Subject: West Acton Library CPA Application 
 
Hi Tori, 
  
I spoke with Kristen on Monday and she said the committee had a few questions about some of the new 
information we provided.  I'm back from vacation and available to answer any questions you may have.  
Just let me know how I can help.  Thanks. 
  

Jennifer Friedman 
Librarian 
West Acton Citizens' Library 
21 Windsor Ave. 
Acton, MA 01720 
978-264-9652 
 


