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TOWN OF ACTON
472 Main Street
Acton, Massachusetis 01720
Telephone (978) 929-6630
Fax (978) 929-6340
engineering@acton-ma.gov

Engineering
Department

INTERDEPARTMENTAL COMMUNICATION

To: Board of Selectmen Date: September 30, 2016

From: Kim Gorman, Office Manager for Municipal Properties
Secretary to Engineering Depl.

Subject: Reimbursement

Please have consideration to reimburse Mr. Henry Hogan for his pre-paid Jones Field Parking fee
of $300.00.

Attached is an email from him stating, due to his current health, he is no longer able to walk to and
from the parking space to the commuter lot. He is looking to obtain his rental fee for October,
November and December ($100 a month, totaling $300)

At this time, | have over a 40 person waiting list and | will be able to re-rent the space.

Thank youl!

Sincerely,
Kim Gorman
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Kim Gorman

From: Henry Hogan <hjhogan3@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, September 30, 2016 12:28 PM
To: Kim Gorman

Subject: Jones Field Parking

Good Afternoon Kim:

Per our conversation today I am vacating my Reserved Parking spot #12 at Jones field effective Oct 1, 2016.
Although it is a very convenient parking spot, the walk to and from the station has made my bilateral plantar
fasciiatis more troublesome.

I had prepaid in SEP for the months of SEP,OCT,NOV and DEC. I am requesting a refund for the months of
Oct, Nov, and Dec,in the amount of $300.00.

Please let me know if you need any further information. I want to say how much I appreciate your assistance
and cooperation in securing this valuable benefit to residents of the Town of Acton.
Best Regards.

Henry Hogan

10 Durkee Rd
Acton, MA 01720
c. 860 770 4440






